
 

 Lot 1 Provide physical exotic vegetation removal 

Lot 2 Provide Monitoring and Maintenance for 1st year 
Lot 3 Provide Monitoring and Maintanance for 4 additional 
years. Per year charge

Estimated Native Vegetation Replant not to exceed $25,000 No Bid

Total Cost Of Project   No Bid
Lot 4 Unit Prices for Planted Native Vegetation  

LOTS All Florida Landscape

 Lot 1 Provide physical exotic vegetation removal 

Lot 2 Provide Monitoring and Maintenance for 1st year 

Lot 3 Provide Monitoring and Maintanance for 4 additional 
years. Per year charge

Lot 4 Unit Prices for Planted Native Vegetation  

 

NOTES: Recommend award to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder Native Technologies.

LIST INCLUDED     
YES  OR NO 

LIST INCLUDED        
YES  OR NO 

ON 11/21/06 AT 2:00 PM AT  2845 S.E. DIXIE HWY., STUART, FL 34997

LOTS 

2

Request Board approval:     12/12/06

Dept. Review:                        11/21/06

Opened By: Jeff Carver

Tabulated by: Garret Grabowski

Bids Received - 3

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARTIN COUNTY, FL. 
BID OPENING FOR  # 1003-0-2006/JC

PROVIDE EXOTIC VEGETATION REMOVAL, TREATMENT, VEGETATION 
RESTORATION AND MONITORING AT HOBE SOUND ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 

$68,131.00

$25,000.00

$4,720.00 $1,300.00

$31,061.25

$6,720.00

$119,601.25$97,420.00

$25,000.00$25,000.00

No Bids - 2

YES  OR NO YES  OR NO 

Aquatic Vegetation control Crossroads Envirnmental

$15,560.00

No Bid

No Bid $40,820.00

Bids Solicited - 1158

Plan Holders - 44

Bid Issued:                             10/19/06

Bid Opened:                           11/21/06

No Bid
LIST INCLUDED          

YES  OR NO 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

LIST INCLUDED       
YES  OR NO 

EAINative Technologies

$12,546.00

$7,690.00

$5,723.75

YES  OR NO YES  OR NO 
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