MCSB APPROVED 6/16/09

EXHIBIT 12-A-1
SCHOOL BOARD OF MARTIN COUNTY, FL
BID TABULATION FOR ITB # 1008-0-2009/JC
EMAIL ARCHIVAL SYSTEM PARTS & SERVICE
BID OPENS: 6/02/09 AT 2:00 PM
Bid Released: 5/19/09 Bids Solicited: 519 |Opened by: Jeff Carver
Bid Opened: 6/02/09 Plan Holders: 23 Tabulated by: Janet Morrow
Dept. Review: 6/02/09 Bids Rec'd: 2/1 No Bid
\I\/IEIKI/IDB(IDERRS ANDITEM MAINLINE INFO MARDEIE_'II:ING INFORMA
ITEM NO. QTY UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE [UNIT PRICE
1 3000 $60,000.00 | $62,280.00( NO BID
2 3000 $9,000.00 | $8,100.00 NO BID
3 3000 $24,000.00 |[$21,540.00 NO BID
4 3000 $24,000.00 |[$21,540.00 NO BID
5 3000 $39,600.00 |$33,840.00| NO BID
6 3000 $5,940.00 $5,130.00 NO BID
7 3000 $15,840.00 |$13,500.00 NO BID
8 3000 $15,840.00 |$13,500.00 NO BID
SERVICES PRICES PER HOUR PER HOUR | PER HOUR | PERHOUR | PER HOUR | PER HOUR | PER HOUR | PER HOUR
1 (per hour) $350.00 $472.25 NO BID
2 (per hour) $250.00 $337.50 NO BID
3 (per hour) $375.00 $506.25 NO BID
ADDENDUM # 1 UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE [UNIT PRICE
1 3000 $24,000.00 | $21,540.00 NO BID
2 3000 $15,840.00 | $13,500.00 NO BID
3 3000 $12,000.00 |$10,770.00 NO BID
4 3000 $7,920.00 $6,840.00 NO BID
5 3000 $36,000.00 |$32,310.00 NO BID
6 3000 $23,760.00 | $20,340.00 NO BID
7 3000 $36,000.00 |$32,310.00 NO BID
8 3000 $23,760.00 | $20,340.00 NO BID

Notes: Recommend award to the lowest responsive and responsible bidders Mainline Info and Dell Marketing
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