MCSB APPROVED ON 5/19/09, EXHIBIT # 11-A-3

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARTIN COUNTY, FL

BID TABULATION FOR ITB # 1002-0-2009/EP

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

BID OPENS: 4/14/09 AT 2:00 PM

Bid Released: 3/26/09 Bids Solicited: 136 |Opened by: Jeff Carver
Bid Opened: 4/14/09 Plan Holders: 32 Tabulated by: Janet Morrow
Dept. Review: 4/30/09 Bids Rec'd: 14

Iltem Description

SYN ANGLE BROOM. STD LTH
HANDLE. (OUR #C90092) No Bid| $4.10 [ $4.20 | $2.83 | No Bid| $5.47 |No Bid| $4.19 | $8.69 [No Bid| $4.34 | $4.25 | No Bid|No Bid

TOY CORN BROOM. 40" LONG W/
WOOD HANDLE. (OUR # C90095) No Bid| $3.26 | $2.04 | $1.63 | No Bid| $3.66 | No Bid| $2.68 | $2.18 [No Bid| $1.64 | $2.45 | No Bid|No Bid

SYNTHETIC 24" PUSH BROOM HEAD.
MUST HAVE FLEXIBLE BRISTLES.
(OUR # C90105) No Bid| $7.82 | $6.55 [ $6.49 [ No Bid[$10.92|No Bid| $7.12 | $9.18 | No Bid|No Bid| $9.10 | No Bid| No Bid

WEBSTER DUSTER HEAD W/ 60" EXT
ADJ HANDLE. WEBSTER BRAND

ONLY. (OUR # C90125) No Bid|No Bid[No Bid| $7.19 | No Bid|No Bid|No Bid| $5.21 | No Bid|No Bid| $7.36 | $2.75 | No Bid|No Bid
PURE WOOL DUSTER W/ 60" EXT

HANDLE. (OUR # C90127) No Bid|No Bid| $4.90 | $7.19 | No Bid|No Bid|No Bid| $5.09 | No Bid|No Bid|[No Bid| $5.20 | No Bid|No Bid
WOOL DUSTER W/ NON-EXT HANDLE

30" LONG. (OUR #C90128) No Bid|No Bid| $3.00 [ $4.18 | No Bid| $4.76 | No Bid| $3.86 | No Bid|No Bid|No Bid|No Bid|No Bid|No Bid
LG FOLD-UP LOBBY DUST PAN. 29"

HDLE. (OUR # C90130) No Bid| $6.44 [$13.50{ $5.83 | No Bid|$15.39|No Bid| $6.54 | $5.92 [No Bid| $8.94 [ No Bid| No Bid|No Bid
STD BLACK PLASTIC DUST PAN. 12"

WIDE (OUR # C90140) No Bid| $1.30 [ $3.20 | $1.14 | No Bid| $3.55 | No Bid| $2.98 | $2.00 [No Bid| $1.74 | $1.95 | No Bid|No Bid
DUST MOP HANDLE. WOOD W/

METAL CLIP (OUR #C90175). No Bid| $5.63 [$10.47| $4.11 | No Bid|$10.86|No Bid| $5.21 | $9.21 [No Bid| $4.74 [ No Bid| No Bid|No Bid
MOP JOHNNY BOWL BRUSH. (OUR #

€90190) No Bid| $0.55 | $2.20 | $0.47 | No Bid| $2.40 [No Bid| $0.53 [ $1.00 |No Bid| $0.61 | $1.25 |No Bid|No Bid

WET MOP HANDLE W/ TEETH.
RUBBERMAID ONLY. MODEL #H22600
60" LONG (OUR #C90195) No Bid] $7.44 1$10.80{$11.04| No Bid|$12.55|No Bid|$11.02|$10.06( No Bid|[$10.54| No Bid| No Bid|No Bid
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PAIL, RND PLASTIC W/ HANDLE. 14
QT SIZE. (OUR #C90215) No Bid| $7.40 [ $6.50 | $6.80 | No Bid|No Bid| No Bid|$10.06| $8.90 [No Bid| $5.97 | No Bid|No Bid|No Bid
FLOOR SCRAPER W/ HANDLE.
UNGER #LH12C ONLY. HOLDS 4.25"
BLADE. (OUR # C90220) No Bid[$12.98($12.67($11.20| No Bid|$15.25| No Bid|$12.84|$14.71|No Bid|[$14.84| No Bid| No Bid|No Bid

BLADES FOR FLOOR SCRAPER.
PK/10. UNGER ONLY. (OUR # €90225)| No Bid| $4.99 | $4.40 | $5.00 [No Bid| $6.98 | No Bid| $5.48 | $5.46 |No Bid| $5.54 | No Bid|[No Bid|No Bid

WHITE BURNISHER FLOOR PADS.
19" DIA. 5/CS. (OUR #C90308) No Bid[$11.50($14.40{$10.46|$30.75|$18.43| No Bid|$11.38|$11.04No Bid|$14.54| No Bid| No Bid|No Bid

RAGS, T-SHIRT. CLEAN /RECYCLED.
25#/BOX. WHITE. (OUR # C90670) No Bid| No Bid|$34.00]$13.95] $37.25|$28.12( No Bid| No Bid|[No Bid| No Bid|$32.34| No Bid|No Bid|No Bid

RAGS, TERRY WHITE. CLEAN/
RECYCLED. HEMMED EDGES.
18"X24" 25#/BOX (OUR # C90671) No Bid|No Bid|$43.70|$18.51] No Bid|$42.18( No Bid|No Bid|No Bid| No Bid|$42.24| No Bid| No Bid|No Bid

LINERS, GARBAGE BAGS. BLACK. 40"
X 46" 100/CASE FLAT PACK. (OUR #

C90325) 12.30 |No Bid|$14.56($16.32| No Bid|$16.78{$14.48| No Bid|$14.07]$12.10]$12.34|$13.80|$14.55($21.00
TOILET PAPER. 96/CS. 500 2-PLY
SHEETS.(OUR # C90370) No Bid|No Bid[$31.50{$30.17| No Bid|$42.80| No Bid|No Bid|$43.01|$38.60(No Bid|$34.45| No Bid|$33.50

SR JUMBO TOILET PAPER. 2-PLY
ROLLS. 3.7"W X 2000'L. 6 RLS/CS. No Bid|No Bid|$23.50{$22.20| No Bid|$25.00( No Bid|No Bid|No Bid|$27.60| No Bid|$27.80| No Bid|$27.10

JR JUMBO TOILET PAPER. 2-PLY 3.7"
X 1000' LONG. 12 RL/CS. (OUR #

C90387) No Bid| No Bid|$22.50[$21.82| No Bid|$24.68| No Bid|No Bid|$29.67($26.10| No Bid|$18.84| No Bid|$18.99
PAPER TOWEL, SINGLE-FOLD. (OUR

#C90380) No Bid|No Bid|$14.95|$15.26| No Bid|{$18.12| No Bid| No Bid|$24.15|$16.99| No Bid|$15.32(No Bid|$15.50
PAPER TOWEL, MULTI-FOLD. (OUR #

C90385) No Bid|No Bid[$14.95|$15.21| No Bid|{$17.82| No Bid| No Bid|$22.71|$15.99| No Bid|$15.00( No Bid|$15.20
PAPER TOWEL ROLL, 8"x800/ROLL.

(OUR # C90381) No Bid|No Bid|$19.45|$19.17| No Bid[$20.81| No Bid| No Bid|$23.70($47.60| No Bid|$18.73| No Bid|$18.70
FACIAL TISSUE. 100/BOX. (OUR

#W60340) No Bid|No Bid| $0.65 | $0.44 | No Bid| $0.64 |No Bid|No Bid| $0.89 |No Bid|No Bid|$15.49|No Bid| $0.53

Recommendation: Staff recommends award to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by item. Awarded vendors include Unipak,
Southern Janitor, S,E, Paper, Neeld Paper, Dade Paper, Calico Industries, All Florida Paper, and Unisource. Blue highlight denotes non-
responsive bids. Notes pertainiing non-responsive bids are on file in Purchasing.
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