MCSB APPR'D ON 10/21/08.
EXHIBIT # 13-A-1

SCHOOL BOARD OF MARTIN COUNTY, FL.

BID OPENING FOR # 1012-0-2008/JC

TERM CONTACT FOR INSTALLATION, REPAIRS, AND/OR PURCHASES

OF A/C, HVAC,, AND REFRIDGERATION

ON 09/23/08 AT 2:00 PM

Bid Released 9-4-08 Bids Solicited: 149 Opened By: Jeff Carver
Bid Opened: 9-23-08 Plan Holders: 14 Tabulated by: Janet Morrow
Dept. Review: 10-6-08 No Bids: 1
. . Florida .
BID SUMMARY PRICE PER HOUR SIS A/C Service Hill York : Siemens Trane
Mechanical
Supervisor during normal Business hours 7:30 - NG Bid $63.27 $98.00 $128.00 $130.00
4:30 PM
Superwsor during nights, weekends, and No Bid $84.90 $147.00 $192.00 $190.00
holidays
Licensed Journeyman during normal business No Bid R R $94.50 $110.00
hours 7:30 AM - 4:30 PM = ' ' : '
Licensed Journeyman during nights, weekends, _
. No Bid $84.90 $112.00 $141.75 $165.00

and holidays
HVAC Controls Tech normal working hours No Bid GG e $108.00 $114.00
7:30 - 4:30 PM = ' ' ' '
HVAC _Controls Tech during nights, weekends No Bid $84.90 $147.00 $162.00 $171.00
and holidays
Apprentice during normal business hours 7:30 No Bid - . 472.00 No Bid
Am - 4:30 PM o= ' ' ' 0B
Apprentlce during nights and weekends and No Bid $74.60 $98.00 $108.00 No Bid
holidays
Fixed Percentage Discount off manf list price on .
Parts/Materials No Bid 26% 25% 12% 20%

Notes: Recommend award to the 2 lowest responsive and resonsible bidders, Hill York and Florida Mechanical LLC. Award

to multiple vendors will help ensure expediant repairs during periods of high demand.
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